



WILLIAMSON COUNTY

Leslie Mitchell, CPPO, CPPB
1320 West Main Street, Suite 130
Franklin, Tennessee 37064
(615) 790-5868
lesliem@williamson-tn.org

May 15, 2017

Intent to Award

Please accept this as notice that Williamson County is issuing the Intent to Award for petroleum products for the Highway Department to Reladyne, subject to approval by the Highway Commission at its meeting on June 7, 2017. Attached is a list of bids received. Any protests regarding the award of this bid must be received in writing by the Williamson County Purchasing Agent no later than 4:30 p.m. Central Time on Monday, May 22, 2017 at the Williamson County Administrative Complex at 1320 West Main Street, Suite 125, Franklin, Tennessee. If no valid protests are received by this date and time, the bid will be awarded within one week after the Highway Commission meeting. The process for protesting award of bids is outlined in detail in the Vendor's Manual, which may be accessed from Williamson County's website www.williamsoncounty-tn.gov.

Leslie Mitchell, CPPO, CPPB
Purchasing Agent

**BID RESULTS 5/9/2017
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS**

Company		Parman	O'Reilly	Reladyne
TSVVZU: Acceptable brands are Shell, Chevron, Mobile, Texaco, or Citgo	Bulk	7.10	no bid	Reladyne 6.75
30WV acceptable brands are Shell, Chevron, Mobile, Texaco or Citgo	5 GI 1 gal Bulk	7.68 per gal 14.43 per gal	89.99 5 gal 19.99	37.90 per pail 14.23 per gallon 54.90 per pail 12.42 per gal
5-30 Conventional	5 GI	11.08 per gal	88.99 19.99	
10-30 Conventional	Quart	\$ 1.94	5.69	1.70
5-20 Conventional	Quart	\$ 1.94	5.49	1.70
5-20 Synthetic	Quart	\$ 3.02	6.29	2.34
Hydraulic Oil				
46A W Hydraulic Oil	5 GI 1 gal	4.50 per gal not available	46.99 13.99	27.92 per pail n/a
ATF(Dextron III/Mercon)	5 GI 1 gal	8.19 per gallon no	no bid 18.99	38.85 per pail 1.65 qt
Universal Tractor Fluid	5 GI 1 gal	8.97 per gallon not available	54.99 16.99	56.20 per pail 15.15 per gallon
Transmission				
75-90 HD synthetic	120 lb	4.11 per lb	592.99	257.12 per keg
50 W synthetic	120lb	4.56 per lb	no bid	304.16 per keg
multi-fak EP2 or equal	120 lb keg 5 gal Cartridge	2.25 per lb 1.96 per lb 2.92 per lb	499.99 135.99 3.99	264.00 per keg 77.43 2.28 per tube
Drillube 320	5 gal 55 gal drum	16.02 per gal 1.78 per gal	no bid 259.99	n/a 94.00 per drum
DEF (for emissions)	2.5 Gal	3.48 per gal	14.99	7.46

Recommend Award to Reladyne